
Mikoyan MiG-31 Interceptor Flightcraft: The
Ultimate Guide
The Mikoyan MiG-31 Interceptor Flightcraft is a supersonic interceptor
aircraft designed and developed by the Mikoyan Design Bureau in the
Soviet Union. It entered service in 1983 and remains in service with the
Russian Aerospace Forces today. The MiG-31 is designed to intercept and
destroy enemy aircraft, particularly high-altitude and high-speed strategic
bombers.
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Design

The MiG-31 is a large, twin-engine aircraft with a distinctive swept wing and
canard design. It is constructed primarily of titanium alloys, which give it
strength and durability. The aircraft has a long, slender fuselage and a high-
mounted tail fin. The wings are equipped with leading-edge slats and
trailing-edge flaps, which provide excellent maneuverability.
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The MiG-31 is powered by two Tumansky R-33D-300 afterburning turbofan
engines. These engines give the aircraft a top speed of Mach 2.83 and a
range of 3,000 kilometers. The aircraft is also equipped with an advanced
radar system and a variety of weapons, including air-to-air missiles and
cannons.

Performance

The MiG-31 is a highly capable interceptor aircraft. It has a maximum
speed of Mach 2.83 and a climb rate of 250 meters per second. The aircraft
is also highly maneuverable, with a maximum turn rate of 12 degrees per
second.

The MiG-31 is equipped with a powerful Zaslon radar system. This radar
has a range of over 200 kilometers and can track multiple targets
simultaneously. The aircraft is also equipped with a variety of weapons,
including the R-33, R-73, and R-60 air-to-air missiles. These missiles give
the MiG-31 the ability to engage enemy aircraft at long, medium, and short
ranges.

Combat Record

The MiG-31 has seen combat in several conflicts, including the Soviet-
Afghan War and the Chechen Wars. In the Soviet-Afghan War, the MiG-31
was used to intercept and destroy Afghan aircraft and provide air cover for
Soviet ground forces. In the Chechen Wars, the MiG-31 was used to
provide air defense for Russian troops and to attack Chechen ground
targets.

The MiG-31 has also been used in a number of international air shows and
exercises. In 1993, the MiG-31 participated in the Paris Air Show. In 1995,



the MiG-31 participated in the Cope Thunder joint exercise between the
United States and Japan.

The Mikoyan MiG-31 Interceptor Flightcraft is a powerful and versatile
interceptor aircraft. It has a long and distinguished combat record and
remains in service with the Russian Aerospace Forces today. The MiG-31
is a testament to the skill and engineering excellence of the Russian
aviation industry.
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